
 

 

July 31, 2017 
 
A special meeting of the Town Board of the Town of Greenville was held on Monday, 
July 31, 2017, at 7:00 pm at Pioneer Hall.  Three board members were present; 
Councilmen Davis and Stern were absent.  Highway Superintendent Terry Williams and 
Code Enforcement Officer Mark Overbaugh were present.  There were no guests.   
Supervisor Macko opened the meeting with the Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
Appropriate verbal notice for an emergency meeting was given to both of the official 
newspapers, the Catskill Daily Mail and the Greenville Pioneer, on July 27, 2017, and 
written notice was posted on the Clerk’s official signboard both inside and out on that 
same day. 
 
This meeting was called to discuss machinery issues at the Highway garage.  
Superintendent Terry Williams received notice that, upon inspection, three of the 
highway department trucks will not pass the NYS safety inspection (the 1982, 1984, and 
1992 vehicles).  The frames are rusted with cracks and cannot be repaired.   
 
Mr. Williams found a 2007 Navistar single axle plow/wing/sander truck with 50,046 
miles, with an asking price of $54,900, and a 2009 Peterbilt tandem 
plow/wing/sander/dump body truck with 92,800 miles.  That asking price is $89,900.  
Supervisor Macko noted that to purchase these types of trucks new would cost an 
estimated $400,000 - $500,000, and have an approximate build-time of 8-12 months.  
He stated that Attorney Rappleyea is looking into financing rates with various banks 
which could be secured by the end of the month.  This dealer can hold the trucks for 
$5,000 each, and would require an additional amount of money as down payment to 
hold the trucks until the financing is obtained.   
 
Mr. Bensen moved, seconded by Mr. Bear, to authorize the Supervisor to make vouchers 
and prepare two checks for $5,000 each to serve as a deposit for these trucks. 
      Carried 3 ayes, 2 absent 
 
Mr. Bensen moved, seconded by Mr. Bear, to authorize the Supervisor to make a 
voucher and prepare a $30,000 down payment to hold these trucks until the bonding is 
received.     Carried 3 ayes, 2 absent 
 
Mr. Bear moved, seconded by Mr. Bensen, to authorize Attorney Rappleyea to proceed 
in securing financing for said vehicles. Carried 3 ayes, 2 absent 
 
There being no further business, this meeting was adjourned at 7:10 pm. 
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